MINUTES OF A MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF TARRANT COUNTY WATER CONTROL AND IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NUMBER ONE HELD IN THE DISTRICT OFFICE IN FORT WORTH, TEXAS, ON THE 3RD DAY OF DECEMBER, 1951, AT 3:00 P.M.

The call of the roll disclosed the presence or absence of Directors, as follows:

## PRESENT

### ABSENT

Joe B. Hogsett Houston Hill Dan H. Priest W. L. Pier Gaylord J.Stone

Also present were Sidney L. Samuels, General Counsel of the District, C. L. McNair, General Manager of the District, Simon W. Freese and J. B. Mapes of the Firm of Freese and Nichols, Consulting Engineers of the District.

Director Hogsett acted in his capacity as President, and Director Priest acted in his capacity as Secretary, whereupon proceedings were had and done, as follows:

1.

The Directors had previously received copies of the minutes of November 14, 1951, at 2:00 P·M·, and November 27, 1951, at 10:00 A· M· Having found no objections thereto it was ordered that they be approved, signed and placed on record·

2.

The monthly report of the Auditors, Pitner and Adams, for the month of October, 1951, was ordered received and filed.

3•

The next matter to be heard by the Board consisted in the written communication dated December 3, 1951, on the letterhead

of Freese and Nichols, Consulting Engineers of the District, executed on behalf of Freese and Nichols by S.W. Freese, concerning the East Fourth Street Bridge over the Trinity River, which letter in substance, notified the Board that attached to the letter was a certified copy of tabulation of bids for the project concerning the construction of the East Fourth Street Bridge above mentioned, which bids were opened on November 27, 1951, and that it was the recommendation of the Engineers (Freese and Nichols), that the contract, when approved, be awarded to Ottinger Construction Company, located at 3101 Camp Bowie Boulevard in the City of Fort Worth, Texas, and that this recommendation by the Engineers was based on the fact that the said Ottinger Construction Company had submitted the lowest and best bid in the total amount of \$324,451.02.

The aforesaid letter having been considered and discussed by the Board, it was resolved that in accordance with said recommendation, the contract for the construction of said East Fourth Street Bridge should be awarded to the said Ottinger Construction Company provided, a contract be tendered to the District in substance and form approved by its General Counsel, and that a good and sufficient bond be executed by the contractors aforesaid, in the sum of money required by the Statutes of the State of Texas governing this District, in a safe and solvent surety company authorized to do business in the State of Texas.

Further, that when said contract and bond shall have been executed in accordance with the requirements herein, that the President, Joe B. Hogsett, and the Secretary, Dan H. Priest, be authorized to execute the said contract on behalf of the District.

On Motion of Director Hill, seconded by Director Pier, the motion to award said contract upon the above named conditions and requirements was unanimously carried, all four directors present voting "Aye" thereon.

4.

There came up for consideration by the Board the matter of advertising notice of the intent of the District to sell a certain tract of 5.61 acres of land in Tarrant County, Texas, owned by the District, purchased from V.A.Vance.

On motion by Director Hill, seconded by Director Priest, such advertisement was authorized, and Mr. E.B. Cheatham, Office Manager, was instructed to look after such advertisement and the proper description of the land.

All four Directors present voted "aye" thereon, and the motion accordingly carried.

5.

The Board next considered the matter of advertising notice of the intent of the District to sell a certain tract of land owned by it, consisting of 165 acres, more or less, known as the Stock Yards Bank Tract, located in Tarrant County.

On motion of Director Priest, seconded by Director Pier, such advertisement for sale of said tract, either in whole or in parcels, was authorized, all four Directors present voting "aye" thereon, and the motion accordingly carried.

5.

President Hogsett reported that, acting under authorization granted to him and Dan H. Priest, Secretary of the Board of Directors,

at a meeting held on October 23, 1951, at 2:00 P.M., they had made exchanges or reinvestments through the Fort Worth National Bank, as follows:

- (a) Out of the proceeds of \$7,000,000.00 maturity value of United States Treasury Bills, dated August 9, 1951, maturing November 8, 1951, owned by the "Construction Fund", there was reinvested for said fund \$6,971,646.00 in United States Treasury Bills, dated November 8, 1951, maturing February 7, 1952. The difference in the proceeds on the matured bills and the cost of the bills maturing February 7, 1952, amounted to \$28,354.00, which said sum was deposited in the District's Statutory Depositary, to the credit of the "Construction Fund".
- (b) Out of the proceeds of \$200,000.00 (\$100,000.00 owned by the Interest and Sinking Fund and \$100,000.00 owned by the Maintenance Fund) maturity value of United States Treasury Bills, dated August 6, 1951, maturing November 15, 1951, there was reinvested \$99,591.00 for each of the above named funds in United States Treasury Bills, dated November 15, 1951, maturity February 14, 1952. The difference in the proceeds of the matured bills and the cost of the bills maturing November 15, 1951, amounted to \$818.00, of which amount \$409.00 was deposited in the District's designated Depositary to the credit of the Interest and Sinking Fund and \$409.00 was deposited to the credit of the Maintenance Fund.
- (c) Out of the proceeds of the maturity value of \$50,000. United States Treasury Bills, dated August 23, 1951, maturity

  November 23, 1951, owned by the Maintenance Fund, there was re-

invested the sum of \$49,802.00. The difference in the proceeds of the matured bills and the cost of the bills maturing February 21, 1952, amounted to \$198.00, which amount was deposited in the District's Statutory Depositary, to the credit of the Maintenance Fund.

President Hogsett then presented five (5) Safekeeping Department Trust Receipts, SK. No. B46701; SK. No. B46726; SK. No. B46727; SK. No. B46763, issued to this District by the Fort Worth National Bank, Fort Worth, Texas, for the above described securities.

The above five receipts were ordered to be deposited for safekeeping in lock box 984, at the Continental National Bank of Fort Worth, the Depositary of the District. All four Directors present voted to receive said trust receipts and to have same deposited as above mentioned for safekeeping, and the action of said President and Secretary of the Board in the foregoing matters, all and singular, was unanimously ratified by the Board.

7.

There being no further business before the Board, the meeting thereupon adjourned.

President

AM TYPA

#### FREESE AND NICHOLS

CONSULTING ENGINEERS
407-410 DANCIGER BUILDING
TELEPHONE 3-5431
FORT WORTH, TEXAS

December 3, 1951

TO BE ATTACHED TO MINUTES OF DECEMBER 3, 1951, at 3:00 P.M.

Board of Directors
Tarrant County Water
Control & Improvement District No. 1
502 Danciger Building
Fort Worth, Texas

Re: East Fourth Street Bridge Fort Worth, Texas

#### Gentlemen:

Please find attached, a certified copy of Tabulation of Bids for the subject project on which bids were opened November 27, 1951.

It is our recommendation that the contract be awarded to Ottinger Construction Company, 3101 Camp Bowie Boulevard, Fort Worth, Texas, as having submitted the lowest and best bid in the total amount of \$324,451.02.

Yours very truly,

FREESE AND NICHOLS

By S. W. Treeze

/he

# FREESE AND NICHOLS CONSULTING ENGINEERS

BIDS TO BE OPENED 10:00 A.M., November 27, 1951

10:00	A.M., November 27, 19	5 <b>1</b>		9. 9. 0/s	/ Leto 8
ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	ITEM DESCRIPTION	· ·	-AL	UN: =
(PAR	T "A", ITEMS COMMON T 940,040 lb.	O ALL FOUNDATIONS) Structural Steel	;	10702044	0.157
2.	9 <b>8</b> S.Y.	Co-Coat Waterproofing		:	2.50
3.	1,034 L.F.	Handrail	•	10,598.50	12.40
4.	3,340 C.Y.	Embankment			, #
5.	330 S.Y.	5" Concrete Rip-Rap			4.90
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PART "A			141, 737.74	
PART "B", I	TEMS & QUANTITIES APP 2,936 C.Y.	LICABLE TO DRILLED SHAFT FOUNDATION (BASE BID) Unclassified Structural Excavation		29,360. <u>00</u>	
2.	100 L.F.	24" Thirthir ats	.00	800,00	a
3.	1,756 L.F.	300 Drilled Shefts		20.00	
4•	528 L.F.	36" Drilled Shafts	22.00	11,616.00	
5.	1,655 C.Y.	Gless """ Concrete		7 785.00	$\uparrow$
6.	315,199 16.	Reinforcing Steel		rug Mang Mang and American	
	SUB_TOTAL FOR PART "B			36 <b>358.5</b> 0	
PART "C", A	LITERNATE ITEMS & QUAN	TITIES FOR CAST IN PLACE PILE FOUNDATION			
1.	4,022 C.Y.	Unclassified Structural Excavation		0	
2.	2,376 L.F.	Cast in place piling (up to 20 ft. lg.)			
3.	5,566	Cast in place pi ft. ).			,
4•	1,722 C.Y.	Class "A" Concrete	•		C
5.	322,100 lb.	Reinfor ing Steel	O		7
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PART "C	n .	•		
PART "D", A	LITERNATE ITEMS AND Q	UANTITIES FOR PRECAST			
1.	4,002 0.77.	Unclassified Structural Excavation		v, <u>225.0</u> 0	) 1
2.	5,556 L.F.	1/ cast Concret			5.70
3•	2,376 L.F.	16" Sc. Precast Concrete Piling	7.25	17,226.00	7.30
4.	1,722 C.Y.	Class "" Concrete	y 1.2 4aa - 1		47.60
5.	322,100 lb.	Reinforcing Steel	0.1225	32,371.05	0.11
S	SUB-TOTAL FOR PART "D"		·	00 6 865.00	
TOTAL BID U	JSING DRILLED SHAFT FO		32 <b>8,09</b> 624		
	ISING CAST IN PLACE PI	* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *	3/0		
		PILING, ALTERNATE FART "A"	: •		
	TIME - CONSECUTIVE CA		02. 4		
COMILETION	TIME - CONDECUTIVE OF	MANAGEMENT DATO	1	300	
		CORRECT COES: BY LOG B. Makes			

2

							۴				
									·		•
						/,0.		6	u w w € ve	/	agentation desired.
Let	80° (0°)	S BOT LOT	portion /s	So For Yets	boug (	of the state of th	or of the state of	XOC YOU	po <sup>no</sup>	el Nath God A	sate,
		, 6	30. \\ \'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\'\	3, 10, 6,	\$ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\ \\	Voly Market Big	2010 July		Po, 170(1)	18. 80 t S.	of sile
2/2/2	, xino	Call A Mis	oo Linis	N. 29/9: 0/9/9	(%) (%) (%) (%) (%) (%) (%) (%) (%) (%)		/5% of	13.00 CO.	4,	6). Og/25,	
AL	B 1 UN:T	TOTAL	5. UNIT	TOTA	C	707A:		TOTAL	B.	TTAL	U
35 <b>28</b>	0.136	127,845 44	0.16	150,406.40	0.1425	133,955.70	0.145	136,305.80	0.16		0
5.00	1.00	98.00	2.00	196.00	1	196.00	3.50	50	3.0	294.00	
60	10.00	10,340.00	12.50	12, 925.00 2 371.40	11.00	11,374.00	10.50	10,857.00	/3.50	13,959.00	. /
7.00	0.38 4.40	1,269.20	0.7/ 6.25	2,062.50	0.65 5.00	1,650.00	6.00	950,00	4.50	1,485.00	
/.55 //. <u>8</u> 8		141.004.64	<u> </u>	167, 961. 30		149 346 70		152,128.40		169,484,40	e gagg
	5.00	14,680.00	17.89	52,525.04	10.50	30,828.00			15.00	44.040.00	
	/7.00	1700.00	20.70	2,070.00	17.00	1700.00			15.75	1,575.00	
	30.00	52,680.00	Property of the Control of the Contr	56,420.28	28.00	49,168.		8	31.50	55,3/4.00	
	40.00	21.120.00				7.,992.50			40.00	20,064.00 65 200.00	
	33.50	55,442.50 37,823.°	40.00	66,200.00	43.50	1., 992.	<u> </u>		20.00 3	89	•
	0.12	183,446.38		545. <sup>72</sup>							
		1	er en g <del>e</del> en en e	, · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	;			, comment of the	1	·	1
						€ . 31		<i>4</i>		*	
		0	9 26	22 20/. 76		9			10.00	23.760.00	
			40.00	68,880.00	, , , ,	)			4		1
	70				H		1 1		011	35 12100	
				35.46						.230,E	
				<u>m</u> .c."						. 50	man (transfer of transfer of t
47.50			15			4	<i>y</i> *	28 on		5/, 280,50	
59.20		( <b>b</b>	7.10	17 0244	7./8	17,059, 68	7.80	33,336.00 18,53280	· • • · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	19,602.00	:
14.60 67.20	1	w	7.19	17.083.44	1.10		1 7.00 1 45.00		2.2	6 = =	
			0.12	38,652.00	1 01/38	36 654, <del>96</del>		35,431.00	0.//	35,431.00	1 0
7.70		F 150	0.16	208 02725		3.8		00 287,80	. 4		* 
id		324,451.02		406,507.06		359,6/5. <sup>09</sup>		No Bio		^ c	•
	!	No B/1		399,595 <u>76</u>			. ***	No Bid		420 005.90	
io/. 50	<u>.</u> 8	No Bid	managaman and an analysis of the second	37 <i>5,</i> /98. <sup>58</sup>			\$ 1			386.347	,
<u>, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , </u>		36c		270		150		380		180	
		celay ir. erials.	mater	gent on -ial deliverie	es	/ee/	/			Days	
				•							

	1			ORT	7/7/2	- 8					
	<b></b>	7 8		/	•	7	•	/		<del></del>	·
				, ,c°,	:10		8	3, 700	, /	Co A Ket	S
	6	The No Vita	9.	h. xo, 3	e to soll	00 + 10 xx 00 010	boly \	e, 4.0° 6	80° 0	X. J. Lei	
	1,00	, + , +	/ '		Leto boll	of why oil	Boy Si	ζ, ζ,	$\langle c_{ij} \rangle$	Central No.	
				N N	9/3/8/7/9/6	5. 1x. 8/0		60 09 V200	Ose vo	7 /x · 6/0 ·	
	3	10		, 0	/ · ·	16	B		/ 6/ V B.	70	/
*	B	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTA	LUNIT		UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	
	2	128.033.45		35.		141,006.00	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	136,305 80	0. 151	141,945.04	•
*	5	11 274	10	#	1.00	98.00	2.75	210 70	11.27	11,653.18	
	00	11,374.00		3,340.0	0.60	2,004.00	·	2,404 80	0.70	2,338.00	
	15	155750			6.00	. 1,980.00	5.25	206250	7.58	2,336 40	
		142,767.=	American	-0,030.		156,462.00	and the second s	152,978 20	The state of the s	158,512 74	•
	•				6	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	,	:	29.35	86,171 60	ű.
į		5			17.50	1750,00		0	16.46	1,646 00	
	is a	· (b)		· ,		21, 912.00		6,	29.53 <b>39.50</b>	50 - 2 - 28 20,856.00	
K	O		Ĺ		46.00	76,130.00	†		56.00	92,680.00	
>						40 975.87			0.14	44,127.86	
					ì	212,819.87				297,5//. 74	
				•	6.75	20,790.00		m 19		On \	
; ;					8.97	49,537.40				6	
:	7	O	<b>,</b>		45.00	77,490.00			4	) - ,	
•	``			7.40	0.13	11,872,00		:			
		i 			i	211,811.		. A. <del>2002-2003</del>			
	00	48,264.00	2	4	6.00	24,132 00	11.00	44,242.00		0	
	70	125,5			<i>5.</i>	44 2 18 00		29,169.00	1	6	
	55	77,938.8°	6. 3	5 <b>5</b> 6.	401	21,384.00		19,602.00			
	35		46.20	550. S8,052		79.2/2.00		35,431.00	1 /2	· · ·	
		33,98/. = 2/5,502.25		1.44	.00	211,049.00		199,046.00			
		//o	•			369,202		No Bia		456,024.48	
		No Bid		Bio	1	368,273.40		No Bid		No Bid	
		358, 269.			<i>4</i>	367, 5/1.00	)	352,024. <sup>20</sup>	<b>)</b>	10 014	
		240 Working		350		300		350 Working		360	
		Os						Days.			
						:					
	• (	6	(	8		(7)		3	(	12)	
	- \			<u> </u>							
						÷			•	,	